

LAW OFFICES OF
HARROLD, SCROBELL & DANNER, S.C.

GREGORY J. HARROLD
 Court Commissioner
 DANIEL D. SCROBELL
 JOHN E. DANNER
 Court Commissioner

P.O. BOX 1148
 MINOCQUA, WISCONSIN 54548-1148
 FAX (715) 356-1504
 Telephone (715) 356-9591

Offices located in
 THE HERITAGE HOUSE
 315 Oneida St.
 Minocqua, Wisconsin

www.hsdlaw.net

Town of Lac du Flambeau
 PO Box 68
 Lac du Flambeau WI 54538

November 20, 2020

Attn: Nancy Edwards, Town Clerk

51300

General

		Rate	Hours	
01/16/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman regarding options for road development; draft correspondence regarding decision	170.00	1.00	170.00
03/23/2020	Telephone conference with Matt Gaulke regarding Town and Tribal resolution re: covid shutdown orders	170.00	0.20	34.00
04/16/2020	Telephone conference with Town Chairman regarding Town closing of boat landing; status of LCO v. Evers case	170.00	0.60	102.00
04/21/2020	Telephone conference with Matt Gaulke re: application to shut down landings; research statutes applicable and advise Chairman	170.00	0.80	136.00
05/18/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman re: enforcement of ordinances; review correspondence; research	170.00	0.60	102.00
06/08/2020	Telephone conference with Carlos Goetz; telephone conference with Town Chairman; review correspondence and websites	170.00	0.80	136.00
06/17/2020	Research bidding statutes; telephone conference with Chairman	170.00	0.50	85.00
06/18/2020	Research and telephone conferences regarding road agreements	170.00	0.40	68.00
06/23/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman; review and draft correspondence; research questions on bidding requirements	170.00	1.00	170.00
07/23/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman re: mask order compliance; research same	170.00	1.30	221.00
07/28/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman; research annual meeting requirements and Town authority in emergency management situation	170.00	1.00	170.00
08/06/2020	Review correspondence	170.00	0.30	51.00
08/07/2020	Review client; correspondence; research telephone conference with	170.00	0.80	136.00

(Continued)
November 20, 2020

Town of Lac du Flambeau

General

		Rate	Hours	
08/13/2020	Telephone conference with Chris Meyer re: bids for contract; changes to contract	170.00	0.60	102.00
10/16/2020	Research methodology for conducting budget hearing/meeting; review Tribal Order in place; telephone conference with Chairman	170.00	2.00	340.00
10/28/2020	Research annual budget meeting issues; travel to Lac du Flambeau and attend Board meeting	170.00	2.00	340.00
	SERVICES		13.90	2,363.00
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			2,363.00
	BALANCEDUE			<u>\$2,363.00</u>

BIA/Tribal Roads

		Rate	Hours	
01/16/2020	Telephone conference with Chairman; telephone conference with property owner regarding information about tribal roads	170.00	0.60	102.00
02/19/2020	Telephone conference with residents on Ross Allen Lake Road regarding property devalue	170.00	0.30	51.00
	SERVICES		0.90	153.00
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			153.00
	BALANCEDUE			<u>\$153.00</u>

Public Access to Open Records Ordinance

		Rate	Hours	
12/16/2019	Review correspondence from Clerk	170.00	0.40	68.00
01/21/2020	Review open records request; research; draft correspondence to client	170.00	0.70	119.00
	SERVICES		1.10	187.00
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			187.00
	BALANCEDUE			<u>\$187.00</u>

(Continued)
November 20, 2020

Town of Lac du Flambeau

Public Access to Open Records Ordinance

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

\$2,703.00

WE NOW ACCEPT VISA AND MASTERCARD. PLEASE CALL FOR
DETAILS. All accounts payable within 30 days. All
accounts not paid within 30 days will be assessed a
Finance Charge at the ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE of 10%

LAW OFFICES OF
HARROLD, SCROBELL & DANNER, S.C.

GREGORY J. HARROLD
 Court Commissioner
 DANIEL D. SCROBELL
 JOHN E. DANNER
 Court Commissioner

P.O. BOX 1148
 MINOCQUA, WISCONSIN 54548-1148
 FAX (715) 356-1504
 Telephone (715) 356-9591

Offices located in
 THE HERITAGE HOUSE
 315 Oneida St.
 Minocqua, Wisconsin

www.hsdlaw.net

Town of Lac du Flambeau
 PO Box 68
 Lac du Flambeau WI 54538

November 27, 2020

51300

LCO v. Evers, et al Case No 18 CV992

US District Court, Western District of WI

Tribe Property Tax Lawsuit

		Rate	Hours	
12/17/2019	Review Plaintiffs Brief opposing Motion to Dismiss and other defendants Briefs	200.00	1.00	200.00
01/03/2020	Review pleadings	200.00	0.30	60.00
01/09/2020	Review Red Cliff v. Bayfield decision	200.00	0.50	100.00
01/13/2020	Review pleadings, correspondence and motions	200.00	1.00	200.00
01/21/2020	Review Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law; review email correspondence and pleadings	200.00	0.50	100.00
02/04/2020	Review briefs and pleadings; draft correspondence; review Red Cliff v. Bayfield case; telephone conference with Atty John Carlson	200.00	1.50	300.00
02/06/2020	Telephone conference with Dennis Ruess regarding handling deposit funds	200.00	0.30	60.00
02/17/2020	Review correspondence from Atty. General, and Pleadings and Briefs	200.00	0.70	140.00
02/18/2020	Review Briefs for Summary Judgment	200.00	1.50	300.00
03/05/2020	Review brief and motions in federal lawsuit by Plaintiffs	200.00	1.00	200.00
03/10/2020	Draft correspondence to Clerk; review correspondence assessor	200.00	0.30	60.00
03/11/2020	Telephone conference with Attorney General regarding status of case	200.00	0.80	160.00
03/12/2020	Telephone conference with Asst. Atty. General regarding status of motions and procedural options	200.00	0.70	140.00
04/01/2020	Draft correspondence to assessor with payment for deposition	200.00	0.30	60.00

Town of Lac du Flambeau

(Continued)
November 27, 2020

LCO v. Evers, et al Case No 18 CV992

	Rate	Hours	
04/09/2020 Review correspondence from Federal District Court Judge; telephone conference with Town Chairman; discuss status of litigation	200.00	1.00	200.00
04/30/2020 Review correspondence from Court; telephone conference with Atty. Schellgel	200.00	0.30	60.00
08/13/2020 review Court of appeals Decision and correspondence to Federal Court SERVICES	200.00	<u>2.00</u>	<u>400.00</u>
		13.70	2,740.00
Long Distance Telephone			<u>5.50</u>
COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			5.50
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			2,745.50
BALANCE DUE			<u>\$2,745.50</u>