

LAW OFFICES OF  
**HARROLD, SCROBELL & DANNER, S.C.**

GREGORY J. HARROLD  
 Court Commissioner  
 DANIEL D. SCROBELL  
 JOHN E. DANNER  
 Court Commissioner

P.O. BOX 1148  
 MINOCQUA, WISCONSIN 54548-1148  
 FAX (715) 356-1504  
 Telephone (715) 356-9591

Offices located in  
 THE HERITAGE HOUSE  
 315 Oneida St.  
 Minocqua, Wisconsin

www.hsdllaw.net

Town of Lac du Flambeau  
 PO Box 68  
 Lac du Flambeau WI 54538

October 28, 2021

Attn: Nancy Edwards, Town Clerk

51300

General

		Rate	Hours	
12/08/2020	Telephone conference with M. Brooks re: initial facts of case re: road discontinuance procedure	185.00	0.30	55.50
01/26/2021	Telephone conference with Chairman; draft correspondence to Clerk regarding road discontinuance	185.00	0.20	37.00
02/17/2021	Conference with Sue Ackland regarding zoning law enforcement	185.00	0.50	92.50
02/18/2021	Draft enforcement letters to two zoning ordinance violators including camper/salvage yard holder	185.00	0.60	111.00
02/24/2021	Review open records request with Town Clerk	185.00	0.20	37.00
05/11/2021	Telephone conference with Chairman regarding Town meeting, and increase of Treasurer's salary, and research regarding same	185.00	0.70	129.50
07/19/2021	Telephone conference with Chairman regarding agenda priority issuance	185.00	0.30	55.50
07/21/2021	Review correspondence from/to Supervisor Hansen	185.00	0.30	55.50
07/26/2021	Draft correspondence regarding village powers/5 person Board; review correspondence from Supervisor Hanson	185.00	1.40	259.00
07/27/2021	Additional research; draft correspondence with opinion	185.00	1.00	185.00
08/02/2021	Draft correspondence re: Lac du Flambeau zoning violation Telephone conference with Chairman; review correspondence; draft correspondence	185.00	1.00	185.00

## General

		Rate	Hours	
08/13/2021	Telephone conference with Chairman regarding attendance at Town Board meeting	185.00	0.30	55.50
08/18/2021	Prepare for and attend Town Board meeting to consider five member board of Supervisors	185.00	2.00	370.00
08/26/2021	Review correspondence from Clerk	185.00	0.30	55.50
09/20/2021	Review correspondence from Lust; draft correspondence to Zoning Administrator	185.00	0.30	55.50
	SERVICES		9.40	1,739.00
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			1,739.00
	BALANCE DUE			<u>\$1,739.00</u>

## LCO v. Evers, et al Case No 18 CV992

US District Court, Western District of WI

Tribe Property Tax Lawsuit

		Rate	Hours	
04/09/2021	Review decision from District Court; telephone conference with Town Chairman	185.00	1.00	185.00
04/12/2021	Review decision with Boulder Junction Town Chairman; draft correspondence to clients and insurance company; review email correspondence from co-Counsel; telephone conference with Atty. Fritz Schellgell	185.00	1.00	185.00
04/14/2021	Conference call with Attorney General; review and draft correspondence; telephone conference with Atty. Schellgell	185.00	0.50	92.50
04/15/2021	Review correspondence from Attorney General; telephone conference with client	185.00	0.50	92.50
04/23/2021	Telephone conference with Atty. Bellavia, M. Gaulke, Mr. Ruess; review correspondence regarding litigation and appeal	185.00	0.70	129.50
05/10/2021	Review appeal pleadings, and draft correspondence			

## LCO v. Evers, et al Case No 18 CV992

		Rate	Hours	
	regarding same	185.00	1.00	185.00
06/03/2021	Draft correspondence to Attorneys Telephone conference with Chairman; review pleading; draft correspondence	185.00	1.80	333.00
06/07/2021	Review email correspondence	185.00	0.50	92.50
06/08/2021	Review correspondence re: brief filing and extension	185.00	0.30	55.50
07/01/2021	Review correspondence from Court of Appeals and note that application to the 7th Circuit Court is required	185.00	0.40	74.00
07/08/2021	Review correspondence and obtain brief of plaintiff	185.00	0.50	92.50
07/19/2021	Review Plaintiff's Brief in Court of Appeals	185.00	1.00	185.00
08/23/2021	Review Brief of Defendant, Appellees, Town of Bass Lake	185.00	0.80	148.00
08/24/2021	Draft correspondence to Attorney General	185.00	0.50	92.50
08/25/2021	Review pleadings	185.00	0.60	111.00
08/27/2021	Telephone conference with Attorney General; draft correspondence	185.00	0.40	74.00
08/31/2021	Review correspondence from Attorney General; file pleading with Court; review correspondence and Brief	185.00	1.00	185.00
09/02/2021	Review correspondence, pleadings, brief and oral arguments information	185.00	1.30	240.50
09/27/2021	Review reply brief and correspondence in case	185.00	0.70	129.50
09/28/2021	Review brief and correspondence in case	185.00	0.50	92.50
10/07/2021	Review filings and correspondence with Court of Appeals	185.00	0.50	92.50
	SERVICES		15.50	2,867.50
	Recording fee Federal Bar Association - access pass			195.00
	COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			195.00
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			3,062.50
	BALANCE DUE			<u>\$3,062.50</u>

Town of Lac du Flambeau  
 Enforcement proceedings Mayer/Nelson

(Continued)  
 October 28, 2021

		Rate	Hours	
03/02/2021	Telephone conference with Kurt Mayer	185.00	0.20	37.00
03/10/2021	Draft correspondence re: Mayer zoning violation; telephone conference with defendant re: same	185.00	0.30	55.50
	SERVICES		0.50	92.50
	Postage			1.10
	COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			1.10
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			93.60
	BALANCE DUE			<u>\$93.60</u>

Ordinance Violation - Lust

		Rate	Hours	
05/26/2021	Conference with Sue Ackland re: prosecution of ordinance violations	185.00	0.70	129.50
	SERVICES		0.70	129.50
	Postage			0.55
	COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			0.55
	TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS			130.05
	BALANCE DUE			<u>\$130.05</u>
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE			<u>\$5,025.15</u>

WE NOW ACCEPT VISA AND MASTERCARD. PLEASE CALL FOR DETAILS. All accounts payable within 30 days. All accounts not paid within 30 days will be assessed a Finance Charge at the ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE of 18%