

LAW OFFICES OF  
**HARROLD, SCROBELL & DANNER, S.C.**

GREGORY J. HARROLD  
 Court Commissioner  
 DANIEL D. SCROBELL  
 JOHN E. DANNER  
 Court Commissioner  
 MICHAEL J. RIELLY

P.O. BOX 1148  
 MINOCQUA, WISCONSIN 54548-1148  
 FAX (715) 356-1504  
 Telephone (715) 356-9591

Offices located in  
 THE HERITAGE HOUSE  
 315 Oneida St.  
 Minocqua, Wisconsin

www.hsdlaw.net

November 30, 2015

Town of Lac du Flambeau  
 P.O. Box 68  
 Lac du Flambeau WI 54538

51300

Attn: Nancy Edwards, Town Clerk

General

	Hours	
03/20/2015 Conference with Sue Ackland regarding road encroachment	0.40	64.00
08/12/2015 Telephone conference with Sue Ackland; conference with Zoning Administrator; review documents	0.80	128.00
09/16/2015 Conference with Jim Rein re: roads in subdivision on Crawling Stone	0.50	80.00
09/17/2015 Conference with Jim Rein regarding road development Municipal Law	0.50 2.20	80.00 352.00
<b>SERVICES</b>	<u>2.20</u>	<u>352.00</u>
Printing and Photocopies		40.00
<b>COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>		40.00
<b>TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>		392.00
<b>BALANCE DUE</b>		<u><b>\$392.00</b></u>

BIA/Tribal Roads

	Hours	
12/12/2014 Research correspondence and review demand to BIA from Congressman	0.30	48.00
12/16/2014 Review files and draft correspondence to Atty. Koopman; review correspondence; telephone conference with Bridget Hubing	0.80	128.00
12/19/2014 Telephone conference with Chairman; draft correspondence to Bridget Hubing; draft correspondence to Atty. Koopman	0.80	128.00

## BIA/Tribal Roads

		Hours	
01/02/2015	Review correspondence from parties; telephone conference with Atty. Koopman and Hubing	0.60	96.00
01/13/2015	Review correspondence from Atty. Bridget Hubing; telephone conference with Town Chairman; review correspondence from Atty. Koopman	1.00	160.00
01/15/2015	Review correspondence from client, and Atty. Hubing	0.40	64.00
01/19/2015	Review FOIR; telephone conference with Atty. Koopman; telephone conference with Chairman	0.70	112.00
01/20/2015	Draft correspondence; telephone conference with Atty. Hubing	0.50	80.00
01/21/2015	Telephone conference with Chairman; review response to FOIA request.	0.70	112.00
01/23/2015	Draft correspondence to attorneys regarding FOIA request to Bureau of Indian Affairs	0.40	64.00
01/26/2015	Review emails and file documents	0.40	64.00
01/27/2015	Telephone conference call with Attys. Koopman and Hubing; review and draft correspondence	0.70	112.00
02/06/2015	Review documents; telephone conference with Atty. Hubing; draft correspondence	0.80	128.00
02/09/2015	Review correspondence from Document Request; telephone conference with Atty. Koopman	1.30	208.00
02/10/2015	Review correspondence	0.20	32.00
02/13/2015	Telephone conference with Atty. Koopman; review summaries	0.60	96.00
02/23/2015	Telephone conference with Atty. Koopman; review correspondence from Town; review documents	0.80	128.00
02/26/2015	Review correspondence and documents	0.80	128.00
02/27/2015	Conference with Atty. Koopman regarding all correspondence and documents from BIA; examine maps	2.50	400.00
03/03/2015	Telephone conference with Matt Gaulke regarding results of document release from BIA	0.40	64.00
03/08/2015	Telephone conference with Atty. Koopman; review correspondence	0.50	80.00
03/09/2015	Conference with Chairman; review maps and all issues raised by response to open records request by BIA.	2.50	400.00
03/23/2015	Review correspondence and email; telephone conference with Atty. Koopman and Bridget Hubing	0.30	48.00
03/26/2015	Review emails	0.40	64.00
03/31/2015	Telephone conference with Chairman; review		

## BIA/Tribal Roads

		Hours	
	correspondence; telephone conference with Atty. Hubing	0.50	80.00
04/13/2015	Review correspondence from Town Chairman, Atty Hubing, Atty. Ralph Koopman; telephone conference with Town Chairman; review correspondence from BIA	0.70	112.00
04/15/2015	Appear at Atty. Koopman's office; conference with Attys. Hubing and Koopman, and Town Chairman.	2.50	400.00
04/30/2015	Attend meeting with Town Board.	3.00	480.00
06/17/2015	Telephone conference with Bridget Hubing re: attendance at meeting should be done	0.40	64.00
07/13/2015	Review correspondence from BIA and Mr. Hanill.	0.80	128.00
07/21/2015	Telephone conference with Bridget Hubing; draft memo to Town Chairman	0.40	64.00
	Telephone conference with Atty. Ralph Koopman; draft memo to file re: review documents	0.40	64.00
07/22/2015	Telephone conference with Bridget Hubing re: status and meeting with Washington DC attorney	0.30	48.00
08/14/2015	Telephone conference with client and Bridgett Hubing re: meeting to review documents with Title Insurance Attorneys.	1.00	160.00
08/17/2015	Conference with Matt Gaulke and Nancy Appleby; discuss options	2.00	320.00
08/19/2015	Conference call with Appleby, Hubing and client	1.50	240.00
09/18/2015	Review Lakeland Times; telephone conference with Town Chairman	0.30	48.00
09/25/2015	Telephone conference with Chairman; draft correspondence to Bob Winat; draft correspondence; research records	0.80	128.00
10/01/2015	Review correspondence from Atty. Bridget Hubing; telephone conference with Atty. Bridget Hubing; telephone conference with Town Chairman	0.70	112.00
10/07/2015	Review correspondence from MSA; telephone conference with Clerk regarding reopening of records request; telephone conference with Bridget Hubing	0.50	80.00
10/14/2015	Telephone conference with Chairman Gaulke regarding status of road issue and title search company	0.30	48.00
10/23/2015	Telephone conference with Atty. Ralph Koopman regarding status of road research	0.30	48.00
	Municipal Law	<u>34.80</u>	<u>5,568.00</u>
	SERVICES	<u>34.80</u>	<u>5,568.00</u>

Long Distance Telephone

7.00

BIA/Tribal Roads

Mileage	34.47
COSTSANDDISBURSEMENTS	41.47
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS	5,609.47
BALANCEDUE	<u>\$5,609.47</u>

TRUSTACCOUNTBALANCE

Opening Balance	\$60.75
TRUSTACCOUNTBALANCE	\$60.75

Brian Zaromski vs Town of Lac du Flambeau

	Hours	
06/08/2015 Conference with Sue Ackland; research	0.70	112.00
06/09/2015 Research statute on Fireworks; telephone conference with Town Chairman; draft correspondence to Fireworks operation	1.00	160.00
06/11/2015 Review correspondence from Brian Zaromski; telephone conference with Chairman; research, draft correspondence	1.50	240.00
06/12/2015 Review correspondence; telephone conference with Chairman; telephone conference with Sue Ackland; telephone conference with Winat; review correspondence	1.00	160.00
06/15/2015 Review correspondence from Zaromski; telephone conference with Chairman and Sue Ackland; draft correspondence	<u>0.90</u>	<u>144.00</u>
Municipal Law	5.10	816.00
SERVICES	<u>5.10</u>	<u>816.00</u>

Printing and Photocopies	0.90
Postage	<u>0.49</u>
COSTSANDDISBURSEMENTS	1.39
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS	817.39
BALANCEDUE	<u>\$817.39</u>

Previous Balance	\$161.54
BALANCEDUE	<u>\$161.54</u>

Open Records Request/ Atty. Adams

	Hours	
08/12/2015 Conference with Chairman; review open records request; review correspondence; research	2.00	320.00
08/13/2015 Telephone conference with Clerk and Chairman; draft and review emails	0.40	64.00
08/20/2015 Work on research; conference with Clerk; review request and law	1.20	192.00
08/25/2015 Telephone conference with client, Clerk and Chairman regarding open records compliance; draft correspondence for Clerk response; research open records.	0.80	128.00
08/27/2015 Telephone conference with Town Chairman and Clerk re: compliance with open records request	0.50	80.00
09/01/2015 Review correspondence; two telephone conferences with Clerk re: correspondence to requester	0.30	48.00
Municipal Law	<u>5.20</u>	<u>832.00</u>
SERVICES	5.20	832.00
Long Distance Telephone		<u>5.00</u>
COSTSANDDISBURSEMENTS		5.00
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS		837.00
BALANCEDUE		<u>\$837.00</u>

Phase 1 Environmental Site Assessment/LDF Tribe

Phase 1 Environmental Site Assessment/LDF Tribe

	Hours	
07/28/2015 Telephone conference with Town Chairman; review correspondence re: meeting of Insurance Representative; Tribe and Tribal claims for contamination	0.60	96.00
09/15/2015 Draft correspondence to Atty. Adams and to MSA Engineers; review same	0.50	80.00
09/24/2015 Review proposal; draft correspondence to Attorney; draft correspondence to Engineer	1.50	240.00
10/01/2015 Telephone conference with Andrew Adams; telephone conference with Chairman; draft correspondence to Coleman Engineering; review file	0.80	128.00
10/19/2015 Review correspondence from Adams; draft correspondence to client Municipal Law	0.80 4.20	128.00 672.00
SERVICES	<u>4.20</u>	<u>672.00</u>
Printing and Photocopies		2.55
Postage		<u>2.45</u>
COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS		5.00
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS		677.00
BALANCE DUE		<u>\$677.00</u>

Town Zoning Ordinance  
Enforcement of Zoning Ordinance

	Hours	
03/05/2015 Conference with Dawn, Zoning Administrator, regarding validity of Lac du Flambeau Ordinance	0.30	48.00
03/31/2015 Review of Bear River Watershed Lake Management Plan Municipal Law	1.50 1.80	 48.00
SERVICES	<u>1.80</u>	<u>48.00</u>
TOTAL SERVICES, COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS		48.00

Town Zoning Ordinance  
Enforcement of Zoning Ordinance

BALANCEDUE	<u>\$48.00</u>
TOTAL BALANCEDUE	<u>\$8,542.40</u>

WE NOW ACCEPT VISA AND MASTERCARD. PLEASE CALL FOR  
DETAILS. All accounts payable within 30 days. All  
accounts not paid within 30 days will be assessed a  
Finance Charge at the ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE of 18%